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INTRODUCllON 

The Interior Plateau Program is a federal-provincial 
multidisciplinary geoscience initiative timded under the 
guidelines of the Mineral Development Agreement. The 
program, ongoing since 1992, and involving projects by 
geoscientists from the Geological Survey of Canada and 
the British Columbia Geological Survey Branch, 
concluded in 1995. Individual projects are currently in 
the write-up sta.ge, with fmal reports to be collated in a 
volume that is scheduled for publication in March, 1996. 

Prospective geological environments for a variety of 
mineral deposits exist in the Interior Plateau as inferred 
from some important mines located in the region (Figure 
1). However, mineral exploration in this region has 
generally been h,ampered by a number of factors, some of 
which include: inaccessibility, vegetation and glacial 
COYW, and a blanket of Neogene lava flows. Outdated 
bedrock mapping and lack of swficial mapping, regional 
gochemistry and modem geophysical coverage were 
major deficiencies in the geoscience database prior to the 
start of the Interior Plateau Program. The plupose of this 
program was to identify mineral potential and promote 
mineral exploration through improved understanding of 
the geology of the region. Furthermore, there is a need to 
develop and evaluate drift exploration models and 
geochemical exploration techniques applicable to drift- 
covered plateau: regions, and to determine geochemical 
patbfmder elements and their significant thresholds in 
tills and lake sediients on the Interior Plateau. 

Projects directed by the British Columbia Geological 
Survey Branch include bedrock: and sticial geology 
mapping at 1:50 000 scale, till and lake sediment 
geochemistry and mineral deposit investigations (Figures 
2 and 3). Mat of these scientific studies were fully 
integrated and conducted in the Nechako Plateau. The 

exception is in the southern Fraser P.ateau, whele 
bedrock mapping along the Coast-Intermontane belt 
boundary was completed in 1995 (see Scl~iariua, 1996; 
this volume). 

.--. 

Figure 1. Tectonstntigraphic tenanes and llhysiognphic 
subdivisions in central British Columbia. 

The integrated approach of projects i 1 the Nechako 
area has been highly successful; significantly imp:rwing 
geological understanding and having a profound impact 
on grassroots mineral exploration. During the 1993 ,Geld 
program, new mineral cxcurences such xs the Tommy 
gold prospect was discovered. More than 1300 Iclaim 
units were staked in 1994; more than ten <ies the :.9!)3 
level, and a 35% increase over 1992. Tbi: activity :.!i tie 
direct result of new discoveries and publ,ication of nw 
geoscience data, specifically bedrock, till and regior~al 
geochemical maps. 
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